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Abstract: 

In hospital settings, standard precautions prevent the transmission of infections. A healthcare worker's failure to 

comply with infection control recommendations may increase his or her risk of exposure to infectious disease, 

particularly during pandemics. This study's objective was to analyze the level of compliance with infection prevention 

and control methods among healthcare professionals in various healthcare settings, particularly primary care 

settings. We scoured the most popular databases, Medline and Embase, for any relevant articles published up to the 

beginning of 2022 that were relevant to our topic. Due to occupational exposure to germs, healthcare personnel may 

contract an infection while administering nursing care. 
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INTRODUCTION: 

Health-care-associated infections (HAIs) are regarded 

as one of the most serious challenges healthcare 

providers faces when providing services to patients. 

These infections are widespread causes of morbidity 
and mortality in hospitalized patients [1]. Improving 

patient safety has received excessive global attention, 

and one of the primary objectives of the World Health 

Organization's World Alliance for Patient Safety [2] is 

to reduce HAIs. Standard precautions were defined by 

the Centers for Disease Control and Prevention in 

2011 as "the minimum infection prevention measures 

that should be applied to all patient care" regardless of 

their suspicion or confirmation of infection status of 

the patients, which are used in all health care settings 

[3]. These precautions should be taken in any setting 

where health care is provided, always assuming that 
the blood, body fluids, secretions, and excretions of 

patients have infectious potential [4,5]. Therefore, 

nurses' knowledge and adherence to standard 

precautions are crucial for reducing the incidence of 

secondary infections [6]. However, the actual 

implementation of standard precautions in clinical 

settings deviates significantly from the 

recommendations and has proven to be somewhat 

problematic [7]. In spite of the awareness of the 

importance of standard precautions in preventing the 

transmission of infectious agents in the workplace, 
low compliance rates among health care personnel 

have been reported globally [7]. 

 

Compliance with standard precautions may be 

affected by environmental factors such as the 

availability of materials and equipment, a manager's 

lack of commitment, or individual factors such as 

knowledge [8]. In order to increase compliance with 

standard precautions and eliminate the factors that 

have a negative impact on compliance, nursing 

practice must undergo significant behavioral changes. 

These behavioral changes may involve education, 
motivation, and organizational modifications. 

Moreover, promoting compliance with standard 

precautions should primarily involve behavioral, 

environmental, and management actions, going 

beyond the individual focus that most institutions 

adopt by placing the blame on the victim [9]. It is 

crucial to note that the incidence of infectious blood 

diseases and the spread of non-blood infectious 

diseases, such as those transmitted through the 

respiratory system, have increased [7,9]. 

 
Compliance has been defined in a number of different 

ways [10,11]. Heynes et al. [12] provided a widely 

accepted definition of compliance in healthcare 

environments [13]. According to this definition, 

compliance is the degree to which a given behavior 

(such as following a physician's prescriptions or 

adopting a healthier lifestyle) is in conformity with the 

physician's instructions or health care advise. A range 

of elements, including culture, economic and social 
considerations, self-efficacy, and lack of knowledge or 

resources, can impact or control compliance. In a 

variety of settings (including health care settings), 

there are behavioral guidelines, but people do not 

always adhere to them. A number of conceptual 

models or theories have been developed in order to 

explain and comprehend the factors that influence an 

individual's compliance with certain guidelines, which 

may in turn contribute to the adoption of certain 

behaviors. The HBM is one of the most frequently 

used models [14,15]. 

 

DISCUSSION: 

Standard precautions (SPs) are the key technique for 

preventing healthcare-associated infections (HAIs) in 

both healthcare staff and patients [16]. SPs are the 

latest and most comprehensive preventative guidelines 

for infectious risk [17]. SPs are predicated on the 

premise that all blood, bodily fluids, secretions, 

excretions (excluding sweat), nonintact skin, and 

mucosal membranes may contain infectious pathogens 

that are transmissible [18]. 

 
Guidelines for SPs include proper hand hygiene, the 

use of gloves and other personal protective equipment 

(PPE), proper cleaning and disinfection of patient care 

equipment and environment surfaces, proper waste 

disposal, proper management of used needles and 

other sharp objects, and proper cough etiquette [19]. 

These measures are essential for effective infection 

control because they prevent the transmission of 

microorganisms from one patient to another via the 

hands or uniforms of healthcare workers, reduce the 

exposure of healthcare workers to infectious agents, 

and decrease environmental contamination [17,18]. 
SPs should be used during all healthcare activities for 

all patients at all times to prevent HAIs among patients 

and healthcare staff, regardless of the known or 

suspected status of infectious pathogens [19]. 

 

Although global health organizations regard SPs as the 

most effective means of preventing HAIs, healthcare 

professionals' compliance with these measures 

remains inadequate. Particularly, compliance with SPs 

should be improved among nurses, who are more 

likely to be exposed to microorganisms associated 
with cross-infections since they provide direct and 

repetitive patient care [17]. Increasing evidence 

suggests that nurse compliance with SPs can 

contribute to the reduction of HAIs among patients 
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and healthcare providers, hence enhancing the efficacy 

and safety of care [19]. 

 

SPs are the work practices required to provide the 

highest level of infection control for the care of all 
patients, regardless of their diagnosis. It refers to all 

policies, processes, and activities aimed at preventing 

or minimizing the risk of infectious disease 

transmission in health care facilities. The 

administration of SPs is suggested for all patients, 

whether or not an infection is suspected or confirmed 

[20]. SPs consist of hand hygiene (routine hand 

washing, hand antisepsis, and surgical hand scrub), 

personal protective equipment (capes, gowns, masks, 

aprons, drapes, closed boots or shoes, sterile drapes), 

prevention of needle stick or sharp injury, waste 

management, instrument processing 
(decontamination, cleaning, and sterilization), 

processing linen, housekeeping, and clinical 

laboratory services [21]. The occupational exposure of 

health care workers to blood and body fluids poses a 

significant risk for the transmission of infectious 

diseases such as human immunodeficiency virus 

(HIV), hepatitis B virus (HBV), and hepatitis C virus 

(HCV) [21]. 

 

Numerous bacteria, many of which can cause serious 

or even fatal infections [12,19], are frequently 
encountered by health care professionals, notably 

nurses. The Centers for Disease Control and 

Prevention (CDC) issued the Standard Precautions, a 

set of guidelines to prevent exposure, in 1996; 

nonetheless, despite the simplicity and clarity of these 

guidelines, it has been noted that compliance among 

nurses is low. Although a high rate of occupational 

exposure to germs is documented among all health 

care personnel, nurses are among the most exposed 

[21]. It is therefore ethical to investigate the factors 

that influence nurses' adherence to SPs. 

 
Regardless of whether a patient is symptomatic, SPs 

rules are intended to decrease the risk of 

microorganism transmission from one person to 

another. When a patient's infection status is confirmed 

or suspected, specific transmission-based measures 

must be followed. There are three sorts of 

transmission-based precautions: airborne, contact, and 

droplet. These involve the addition of transmission-

based techniques to those of Standard Precautions, and 

they are employed in conjunction with SPs. Numerous 

infections can be treated just with SPs and do not 
necessitate further precautions [22]. 

 

Since their initial introduction, SPs have been 

implemented globally, with frequent updates 

provided. Although many guidelines for the control of 

specific microorganisms, such as Clostridium difficile 

and norovirus, have been developed, these guidelines 

have supplemented Standard Precautions [23] rather 

than replacing them. 
 

Despite the widespread adoption of Standard 

Precautions by organizations, implementation gaps 

have been identified among healthcare professionals, 

and percutaneous injuries from needlesticks and 

sharps continue to occur [24]. Unsuitable 

infrastructure, such as lack of handwashing facilities, 

lack of awareness concerning transmission, 

insufficient personal protective equipment (PPE), 

risky worker behaviors, and inadequate working 

circumstances are cited as obstacles by healthcare 

professionals [25]. Therefore, interventions have been 
developed to encourage Standard Precautions 

implementation as the foundation for infection 

prevention and control. 

 

The education program [26] also included classroom 

instruction regarding disease transmission, SPs, and 

PPE use. In this study, education was provided to both 

the intervention and control groups, which differs 

from the methodology described in earlier research. In 

addition, the intervention group received a visual 

representation of particle dispersion in the respiratory 
tract. The authors of the study did not indicate the 

length of the instructional session. 

 

Two trials introduced support for infection control to 

an educational curriculum. In addition to a two-hour 

training session that included lectures and practical 

demonstrations of hand hygiene and decontamination 

of equipment and the surroundings, an infection 

control link nurse was assigned to the intervention 

group [27]. 

 

One study [28] provided an intervention that 
emphasized peer evaluation. Participants in the 

intervention group received information on peer 

evaluation and applicable instruments. During the 

intervention phase, participants evaluated their peers 

but did not provide feedback to individuals; instead, 

they provided input to the unit 11 times over the course 

of six weeks. The control group did not get any 

treatment. 

 

In contrast to the other trials, the intervention in one 

[29] study was not educational. The intervention for 
radiology porters consists of a checklist and colored 

cues to promote infection control measures. The 

research involved four groups. Two groups 

independently evaluated the checklist and signals, 
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while one group evaluated them together, and the 

fourth group received no intervention. The same 

porters participated in each study group. 

 

Thus, interventions differed between trials. No 
research established the intervention's theoretical 

foundations, such as whether it was based on a 

particular theory or paradigm for behavior change. 

Additionally, the period of follow-up differed. Two 

studies reported a followup term of one month, one a 

followup period of three months, two a followup 

period of four months, one a followup period of six 

months, and one a followup period of 12 months [30]. 

 

Two cluster-randomized trials evaluating the addition 

of infection control support to education used infection 

control link nurses and offered 24-hour telephone 
help. The control group received no treatment. In 

terms of audits of different suggested practices, both 

studies documented compliance at the institution level 

rather than the person level. The authors of both trials 

did not conduct a matched analysis as required by their 

respective designs. Overall, audited practices have 

improved, however there is considerable 

heterogeneity between long-term care facilities and 

audited practices [31.32]. 

 

Regarding compliance with other Personal Protective 
Equipment (goggles, masks, and gown), the results of 

this study indicated that 24.8% of total nurses typically 

wear a face mask to protect nasal and oral mucosa 

during procedures that may result in spraying of blood 

and body fluids, while 33.5% occasionally wear a face 

mask. This conclusion was consistent with prior 

research [33]. On the other hand, 6.8% of participants 

wore protective suits (gowns) always, 12.0% wore 

them frequently, and 43.6% wore them infrequently. 

Unfortunately, these percentages were somewhat low 

in comparison to other research [34], and extra 

attention must be paid to this issue in orientations, 
seminars, and educational classes. However, other 

studies have indicated similarly low compliance rates 

for personal protective equipment [33,35], which may 

be attributable to a lack of these types of equipment in 

the departments. 

 

Nonetheless, the sample's overall compliance rate 

reveals significant areas for improvement, but it was 

higher than the compliance rates reported by nurses in 

Hong Kong, Brazil, and Saudi Arabia in earlier 

research using the same instrument [36]. Compared to 
other studies that published participant characteristics, 

our sample had a similar distribution of participants by 

gender, was younger and less experienced than 

Brazilian nurses, but older and more experienced than 

Hong Kong nurses. These researchers did not record 

the educational level of the nurses or if participants 

had received specific training on SPs [36]. Our group 

was highly educated, and the majority of nurses had 

attended SPs training. This may be one of the reasons 
why our sample's compliance rate was higher than that 

of earlier studies. However, more study is required to 

clarify the factors that influence nurse compliance 

with SPs across nations [36]. 

 

CONCLUSION: 

SPs are the most essential infection prevention and 

control measures for preventing the transfer of germs 

to other patients or healthcare professionals. 

Therefore, encouraging nurses to engage in these 

activities as frontline workers is a fundamental aspect 

of infection control. Managers should assess 
compliance with SPs among clinical nurses with more 

vigilance in order to create and evaluate interventions 

tailored to their needs. The balance of these positively 

or adversely influential factors may have an effect on 

adopted behavior. If the reasons that tend to 

noncompliance outweigh those that lead to 

compliance, Standard Precautions are unlikely to be 

followed. Consequently, it is vital to identify the 

elements that influence compliance (both positively 

and negatively) and to establish strategies to eliminate 

those that prevent the adoption of Standard 
Precautions and promote those that facilitate their 

implementation. 

 

REFERENCES: 

1. Sydnor E.R.M., Perl T.M. Hospital epidemiology 

and infection control in acute-care settings. Clin. 

Microbiol. Rev. 2011;24(1):141–173.  

2. Pittet D., Allegranzi B., Sax H., Bertinato L., 

Concia E., Cookson B. Considerations for a WHO 

European strategy on health-care-associated 

infection, surveillance, and control. Lancet Infect. 

Dis. 2005;5(4):242–250. 
3. CDC . National Center for Emerging and 

Zoonotic Infectious Diseases, Division of 

Healthcare Quality Promotion; 2011. Basic 

Infection Control and Prevention Plan for 

Outpatient Oncology Settings.  

4. Luo Y., He G.-P., Zhou J.-W., Luo Y. Factors 

impacting compliance with standard precautions 

in nursing, China. Int. J. Infect. 

Dis. 2010;14(12):e1106–e1114.  

5. Darawad M.W., Al-Hussami M. Jordanian 

nursing students' knowledge of, attitudes towards, 
and compliance with infection control 

precautions. Nurse Educ. 

Today. 2013;33(6):580–583.  



IAJPS 2022, 09 (12), 953-958    Abdulrahman Ahmad Qasem Salem et al     ISSN 2349-7750 

 

w w w . i a j p s . c o m  
 
 

 

Page 957 
 

 

6. Sreenuvasu Mudedla W.L.T., Reddy K.T., 

Sowribala M. A study on knowledge and 

awareness of standard precautions among health 

care workers at Nizam's institute of medical 

sciences Hyderabad. J. Natl. Accred. Board Hosp. 
Healthc. Providers. 2014;1(2)  

7. Vaz K., McGrowder D., Alexander-Lindo R., 

Gordon L., Brown P., Irving R. Knowledge, 

awareness and compliance with universal 

precautions among health care workers at the 

University Hospital of the West Indies, 

Jamaica. Int. J. Occup. Environ. 

Med. 2010;1(4):171–181.  

8. Gammon J., Gould D. Universal precautions: a 

review of knowledge, compliance and strategies 

to improve practice. J. Res. 

Nurs. 2005;10(5):529–547.  
9. Miranzi SdSC., Gaspar AACdS., Iwamoto H.H., 

Miranzi M.A.S., Dziabas D.C. Acidentes de 

trabalho entre os trabalhadores de uma 

universidade pública. Revista Brasileira de Saúde 

Ocupacional. 2008;33:40–47. 

10. Cameron C. Patient compliance: recognition of 

factors involved and suggestions for promoting 

compliance with therapeutic regimens. J Adv 

Nurs. 1996;24(2):244–250. doi: 10.1046/j.1365-

2648.1996.01993.x.  

11. Bissonnette JM. Adherence: a concept analysis. J 
Adv Nurs. 2008;63(6):634–643. doi: 

10.1111/j.1365-2648.2008.04745.x.  

12. Haynes RB, Sackett DL, Taylor DW. Compliance 

in health care. Baltimore: John Hopkins 

University Press; 1979.  

13. Ogden J. Helath Psychology: a Textbook. 4. 

Buckingham: Open University Press; 2007.  

14. Hazavehei SM, Taghdisi MH, Saidi M. 

Application of the Health Belief Model for 

osteoporosis prevention among middle school girl 

students, Garmsar, Iran. Educ Health (Abingdon) 

2007;20(1):23.  
15. Daddario DK. A review of the use of the health 

belief model for weight management. Medsurg 

Nurs. 2007;16(6):363–366. 

16. Siegel J.D., Rhinehart E., Jackson M., Chiarello 

L. Health Care Infection Control Practices 

Advisory Committee. 2007 Guideline for 

isolation precautions: Preventing transmission of 

infectious agents in health care settings. Am. J. 

Infect. Control. 2007;35(Suppl. 2):S65–S164. 

doi: 10.1016/j.ajic.2007.10.007.  

17. Centers for Disease Control and Prevention 
(CDC) Supplement I: Infection Control in 

Healthcare, Home, and Community Settings. 

Appendix II: Recommendations for Application 

of Standard Precautions for the Care of All 

Patients in Health Care Settings. CDC; Atlanta, 

GA, USA: 2004.  

18. World Health Organization . Regional Office for 

the Western Pacific. Practical Guidelines for 

Infection Control in Health Care Facilities. WHO 
Regional Office for the Western Pacific; Manila, 

Philippines: 2004.  

19. Pereira F.M.V., Lam S.C., Chan J.H.M., 

Malaguti-Toffano S.E., Gir E. Difference in 

compliance with Standard Precautions by nursing 

staff in Brazil versus Hong Kong. Am. J. Infect. 

Control. 2015;43:769–772. doi: 

10.1016/j.ajic.2015.03.021.  

20. Lam S.C. Validation and cross-cultural pilot 

testing of compliance with standard precautions 

scale: Self-administered instrument for clinical 

nurses. Infect. Control Hosp. Epidemiol. 
2014;35:547–555. doi: 10.1086/675835.  

21. Stilo A., Troiano G., Melcarne L., Gioffrè M.F., 

Nante N., Messina G., Laganà P. Hand washing 

in operating room: a procedural comparison. 

Epidemiol. Biostat. Public Health. 2016;13 doi: 

10.2427/11734. 

22. Al-Faouria I., Okour S.H., Alakour N.A., 

Alrabadi N. Knowledge and compliance with 

standard precautions among registered nurses: A 

cross-sectional study. Annals of Medicine and 

Surgery. 2021;62:419–424. doi: 
10.1016/j.amsu.2021.01.058.  

23. Al-Rawajfah O.M., Tubaishat A. A concealed 

observational study of infection control and safe 

injection practices in Jordanian governmental 

hospitals. American Journal of Infection Control. 

2017;45(10):1127–1132. doi: 

10.1016/j.ajic.2017.04.293. [PubMed] 

[CrossRef] [Google Scholar] 

24. Atif M.L., Brenet A., Hageaux S., Fave M.H., 

Cochet C., Baticle E.…Standard precautions 

work group Awareness of standard precautions 

for 4439 healthcare professionals in 34 
institutions in France. Médecine et Maladies 

Infectieuses. 2013;43(1):10–16. doi: 

10.1016/j.medmal.2012.11.004.  

25. Avci M., Ozgenc O., Coskuner S.A., Olut A.I. 

Hospital acquired infections (HAI) in the elderly: 

Comparison with the younger patients. Archives 

of Gerontology and Geriatrics. 2012;54(1):247–

250. doi: 10.1016/j.archger.2011.03.014. 

26. Beyamo A., Dodicho T., Facha W. Compliance 

with standard precaution practices and associated 

factors among health care workers in Dawuro 
Zone, South West Ethiopia, cross sectional study. 

BMC Health Services Research. 2019;19(1):381. 

doi: 10.1186/s12913-019-4172-4.  



IAJPS 2022, 09 (12), 953-958    Abdulrahman Ahmad Qasem Salem et al     ISSN 2349-7750 

 

w w w . i a j p s . c o m  
 
 

 

Page 958 
 

 

27. Cabana M.D., Rand C.S., Powe N.R., Wu A.W., 

Wilson M.H., Abboud P.A., Rubin H.R. Why 

don’t physicians follow clinical practice 

guidelines? A framework for improvement. 

JAMA. 1999;282(15):1458–1465. doi: 
10.1001/jama.282.15.1458. 

28. Dhedhi N.A., Ashraf H., Jiwani A. Knowledge of 

standard precautions among healthcare 

professionals at a Teaching Hospital in Karachi, 

Pakistan. Journal of Family Medicine and 

Primary Care. 2021;10(1):249–253. doi: 

10.4103/jfmpc.jfmpc_1622_20. 

29. Ong MS, Magrabi F, Post J, Morris S, Westbrook 

J, Wobcke W. Communication interventions to 

improve adherence to infection control 

precautions: a randomised crossover trial. BMC 

Infectious Diseases 2013;13:72. 
30. Adebayo O, Labiran A, Imarhiagbe L. Standard 

Precautions in clinical practices: a review. 

International Journal of Health Sciences and 

Research 2015;5:521‐8. 

31. Andersson AE, Bergh I, Karlsson J, Nilsson K. 

Patients' experiences of acquiring a deep surgical 

site infection: an interview study. American 

Journal of Infection Control 2010;38(9):711‐7. 

32. Gopal RG, Jeanes A, Russell H, Wilson D, Atere‐

Roberts E, O'Sullivan D. Effectiveness of short‐

term, enhanced, infection control support in 
improving compliance with infection control 

guidelines and practice in nursing homes: a 

cluster randomized trial. Epidemiology & 

Infection 2009;137(10):1465‐71. 

33. Alnoumas S.R., Enez F.A., Isaeed M.A., Makboul 

G., El-Shazly M.K. Knowledge, attitude and 

behavior of primary health care workers regarding 

health care-associated infections in Kuwait. 

Greener J. Med. Sci. 2012;2(4). 

34. Okechukwu E., Motshedisi C. Knowledge and 

practice of standard precautions in public health 

facilities in Abuja, Nigeria. Int. J. Infect. Contr. 
Aug 2012;8(3). 

35. Luo L., Shu-Fang K., Oi-Ling S., Chang-Qin L. 

Work stressors, Chinese coping strategies, and job 

performance in Greater China. Int. J. Psychol. 

2010;45(4):294–302. 

36. Luo Y., He G.-P., Zhou J.-W., Luo Y. Factors 

impacting compliance with standard precautions 

in nursing, China. Int. J. Infect. Dis. 

2010;14(12):e1106–e1114. 

 


